#### **Standard Product Handling Fees**

| Bid Price       | Seller Fee | <b>Buyer Fee</b> | Scratch Fee | No Bid Fee |
|-----------------|------------|------------------|-------------|------------|
| 0 ¢ - 35 ¢      | 5 ¢/lb.    | 5 ¢/lb.          | 10 ¢/lb.    |            |
| 36 ¢ - 75 ¢     | 8 ¢/lb.    | 8 ¢/lb.          | 16 ¢/lb.    | 9.0 ¢/lb.  |
| 76 ¢ - 99 ¢     | 10 ¢/lb.   | 10 ¢/lb.         | 20 ¢/lb.    | 9.0 ψ/Ιδ.  |
| \$1.00 - \$1.49 | 13 ¢/lb.   | 13 ¢/lb.         | 26 ¢/lb.    |            |
| \$1.50 and over | 14 ¢/lb.   | 14 ¢/lb.         | 28 ¢/lb.    |            |

#### **Special Product Handling Fees**

| <u>Item</u>        | Seller Fee | Buyer Fee | Scratch Fee | No Bid Fee |
|--------------------|------------|-----------|-------------|------------|
| Shrimp & Shellfish | 10 ¢/lb.   | 10 ¢/lb.  | 20 ¢/lb.    | 0.0 4/16   |
| Dogfish            | 12 ¢/lb.   | 12 ¢/lb.  | 24 ¢/lb.    | 9.0 ¢/lb.  |
| Herring Pumping    | \$7/ton    | N/A       | N/A         |            |

#### **Berthing**

| Daily Berthing Rate      |                        | Monthly Berthing Rate    |
|--------------------------|------------------------|--------------------------|
| 56¢/foot                 | Length measured as LWL | \$9.50/foot              |
| Shore power as available |                        | Includes 1 parking space |

#### Warehousing/Cold Storage/Misc. Unloading

| Pallet Transfers (trucks & boats) | \$6/each - includes 24-hour cold storage    |
|-----------------------------------|---|
| Seaweed (in-out)                  | \$1/bag - including cold storage            |
| Misc. handling (in-out for boats) | \$25/pallet                                 |
| Misc. unloading                   | 12¢/lb.                                     |
| Cold Storage – Weekly             | \$11/pallet plus a \$14/pallet handling fee |
| Cold Storage - Monthly            | \$16/pallet plus a \$14/pallet handling fee |

# **Lumping Fees**

| Lbs. Hailed             | PFE Crew | <u>Minimum Fee</u> |  |  |  |
|-------------------------|----------|--------------------|--|--|--|
| 0-5,000                 | 1        | \$150              |  |  |  |
| 5,001 - 10,000          | 2        | \$300              |  |  |  |
| 10,001 - 50,000         | 3        | \$450              |  |  |  |
| 50,001 +                | 4        | \$600              |  |  |  |
| Surcharge after Minimum |          |                    |  |  |  |
|                         | Crew     |                    |  |  |  |
| 5,001 - 10,000          | 1        | 3.0 ¢/lb.          |  |  |  |
| 10,001 +                | 2        | 3.0 ¢/lb.          |  |  |  |
| 10,001 - 50,000         | 3        | 3.0 ¢/lb.          |  |  |  |
| 50,001+                 | 3-4      | 3.5 ¢/lb.          |  |  |  |

## **Production Services**

| 100 lb. / 125 lb. box - filled, marked & iced  | \$8.75/box                             |
|--|--|
| 50 lb. / 60 lb. carton – filled, marked & iced | \$6.75/carton (re-weigh fee may apply) |
| Bulk Bin / 1500 lb. – marked & iced            | \$25/bin – pallet extra                |
| Steaking lg. fish (gross weight)               | 4.5¢/lb.                               |
| Steak med. fish or blend (gross weight)        | 5.5¢/lb.                               |
| Repack & ice into box, carton, bulk bin        | 4.5¢/lb.                               |
| Cull/weigh check (no chg. <95% accurate)       | 4.5¢/lb.                               |
| Re-ice only                                    | 1.0¢/lb.                               |

## **Supplies**

| Totes: Purchase   Rental (100+ totes \$8.25/each) | \$9.00 each   25¢/week      |
|---|-----------------------------|
| Bin rental  | \$40/month                  |
| Pallets purchase                                  | \$4.00                      |
| Ice resale: Tote   Bin (approximately ½ ton)      | \$4.00/ tote   \$40.00/ bin |
| Shrink wrap                                       | \$15/roll                   |
| Marking crayons                                   | \$15/box                    |

# Misc. Charge

| Parking      | \$40/month |  |  |
|--------------|------------|--|--|
| Research fee | \$30/hour  | For account information 60 days or older |  |

#### **Standard Product Handling Fees**

| Bid Price       | Seller Fee | <b>Buyer Fee</b> | Scratch Fee | No Bid Fee |
|-----------------|------------|------------------|-------------|------------|
| 0 ¢ - 35 ¢      | 5 ¢/lb.    | 5 ¢/lb.          | 10 ¢/lb.    |            |
| 36 ¢ - 75 ¢     | 8 ¢/lb.    | 8 ¢/lb.          | 16 ¢/lb.    | 9.0 ¢/lb.  |
| 76 ¢ - 99 ¢     | 10 ¢/lb.   | 10 ¢/lb.         | 20 ¢/lb.    | 9.0 ψ/ΙΒ.  |
| \$1.00 - \$1.49 | 13 ¢/lb.   | 13 ¢/lb.         | 26 ¢/lb.    |            |
| \$1.50 and over | 14 ¢/lb.   | 14 ¢/lb.         | 28 ¢/lb.    |            |

#### **Special Product Handling Fees**

| <u>Item</u>        | Seller Fee | Buyer Fee | Scratch Fee | No Bid Fee |
|--------------------|------------|-----------|-------------|------------|
| Shrimp & Shellfish | 10 ¢/lb.   | 10 ¢/lb.  | 20 ¢/lb.    | 0.0 4/16   |
| Dogfish            | 12 ¢/lb.   | 12 ¢/lb.  | 24 ¢/lb.    | 9.0 ¢/lb.  |
| Herring Pumping    | \$7/ton    | N/A       | N/A         |            |

#### **Berthing**

| Daily Berthing Rate      |                        | Monthly Berthing Rate    |
|--------------------------|------------------------|--------------------------|
| 56¢/foot                 | Length measured as LWL | \$9.50/foot              |
| Shore power as available |                        | Includes 1 parking space |

#### Warehousing/Cold Storage/Misc. Unloading

| Pallet Transfers (trucks & boats) | \$6/each - includes 24-hour cold storage    |
|-----------------------------------|---|
| Seaweed (in-out)                  | \$1/bag - including cold storage            |
| Misc. handling (in-out for boats) | \$25/pallet                                 |
| Misc. unloading                   | 12¢/lb.                                     |
| Cold Storage – Weekly             | \$11/pallet plus a \$14/pallet handling fee |
| Cold Storage - Monthly            | \$16/pallet plus a \$14/pallet handling fee |

# **Lumping Fees**

| Lbs. Hailed     | PFE Crew                | <u>Minimum Fee</u> |
|-----------------|-------------------------|--------------------|
| 0-5,000         | 1                       | \$150              |
| 5,001 - 10,000  | 2                       | \$300              |
| 10,001 - 50,000 | 3                       | \$450              |
| 50,001 +        | 4                       | \$600              |
|                 | Surcharge after Minimum |                    |
|                 | Crew                    |                    |
| 5,001 - 10,000  | 1                       | 3.0 ¢/lb.          |
| 10,001 +        | 2                       | 3.0 ¢/lb.          |
| 10,001 - 50,000 | 3                       | 3.0 ¢/lb.          |
| 50,001+         | 3-4                     | 3.5 ¢/lb.          |

## **Production Services**

| 100 lb. / 125 lb. box - filled, marked & iced  | \$8.75/box                             |
|--|--|
| 50 lb. / 60 lb. carton – filled, marked & iced | \$6.75/carton (re-weigh fee may apply) |
| Bulk Bin / 1500 lb. – marked & iced            | \$25/bin – pallet extra                |
| Steaking lg. fish (gross weight)               | 4.5¢/lb.                               |
| Steak med. fish or blend (gross weight)        | 5.5¢/lb.                               |
| Repack & ice into box, carton, bulk bin        | 4.5¢/lb.                               |
| Cull/weigh check (no chg. <95% accurate)       | 4.5¢/lb.                               |
| Re-ice only                                    | 1.0¢/lb.                               |

## **Supplies**

| Totes: Purchase   Rental (100+ totes \$8.25/each) | \$9.00 each   25¢/week      |
|---|-----------------------------|
| Bin rental  | \$40/month                  |
| Pallets purchase                                  | \$4.00                      |
| Ice resale: Tote   Bin (approximately ½ ton)      | \$4.00/ tote   \$40.00/ bin |
| Shrink wrap                                       | \$15/roll                   |
| Marking crayons                                   | \$15/box                    |

# Misc. Charge

| Parking      | \$40/month |  |  |
|--------------|------------|--|--|
| Research fee | \$30/hour  | For account information 60 days or older |  |